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Analysis of Data on Accidental Falls from the Hospital Incident
l

Reporting in a General Hospita
Yu-ri Jang’, Jeong Yun Park?

'RN, Department of Quality & Patient Safety Team, Veterans Health Service Medical Center, Seoul, ?Professor, Department of
Clinical nursing, University of Ulsan, Seoul, Republic of Korea

Purpose: The purpose of this study was to analyze data on fall incidents based on a general hospital's incident reporting
system.

Methods: This study conducted secondary data analysis to gather statistics on fall reports, general characteristics of
patients, results of falls, and improvement strategies for fall prevention using the 2017-2019 fall incidents from the
incident report system.

Results: There were 693 cases reported over three years. Among the fall incidents, three hundred twenty (46.2%) were
adverse events, three hundred seventy-three (53.8%) were near misses, and none were related to sentinel events. Five
hundred ninety-five (85.9%) were male, with an average age of 74.08+8.99. The falling incidents happened mostly in
patients’ rooms (410, 59.1%). At the time of the fall, the patients were conscious and alert (607, 87.6%). As a result of the
fall, three hundred sixty (51.9%) caused no harm, permanent damage, side effects, or death.

Conclusion: The study findings suggest that the fall characteristics of older patients should be considered to establish a
fall-prevention strategy tailored to the institution.
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Table 1. Overall statistics of fall report.
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(N=693)

Year Total (n=693) Near miss (n=693) Adverse incident (n=320)
Total 693 (100.0) 373 (53.8) 320 (46.2)
2017 205 (100.0) 88 (42.9) 117 (57.1)
2018 202 (100.0) 106 (52.5) 96 (47.5)
2019 286 (100.0) 179 (62.6) 107 (37.4)
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Table 2. Results of pilot survey.

(N=693)
Characteristics Categories n(%) or M£SD
Gender Male 595 (85.9)
Female 88 (14.1)
Age (year) 74.08+8.99
<60 25 (3.5)
60-69 112 (16.2)
70-79 380 (54.8)
>80 176 (25.5)
Type of patient Inpatient 26 (3.8)
Outpatient 667 (96.2)
Department Medical unit 444 (64.1)
Surgical unit 243 (35.1)
Others (dentistry, pain clinic) 6(0.8)
Mental status Alert 607 (87.6)
Drowsy 48 (6.9)
Stupor 33 (4.8)
Semi coma 4(0.6)
Coma 1(0.1)
Activity status Independent 208 (30.0)
Required assistance 315 (45.5)
Required help always 145 (20.9)
Dependent 16 (2.3)
Bed ridden 9(1.3)
Risk factor related to fall* Gait disturbance 390 (37.0)
Consciousness disorder 114 (10.8)
Cardiovascular problems 104 (9.9)
Emotional disturbances 63 (6.0)
Urinary problems 60 (5.7)
Hearing impairment 44 (4.2)
Defecation problems 16 (1.5)
Visual impairment 13 (1.2)
Medications** within 24hr 249 (23.6)
Discoverer Nurse 360 (51.9)
Guardian 196 (28.3)
Caregiver 45 (6.5)
Others (patient, nearby patients) 92 (13.3)
Places of fall Patient room 410 (59.1)
Corridors 97 (14.0)
Bathroom 64 (9.2)
Others (elevator, stairs, etc.) 122 (17.7)
Duty time Day (07:00-14:59) 202 (29.1)
Evening (15:00-22:59) 214 (30.9)
Night (23:00-06:59) 274 (39.5)
Not recorded 3(0.4)
Time taken from reporting
Near miss (n=373) <6 days 370 (99.2)
>7 days 2(0.5)
Not recorded 1(0.3)
Adverse incidents (n=320) <24 hrs 270 (84.4)
>24 hrs 48 (15.0)
Not recorded 2(0.6)

* Multiple responses

**Diuretics, Antihypertensive drugs, Hypoglycemic agent, Antiseizure drugs, Narcotics, Antipsychotics.
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Table 3. Result of falls.

(N=693)

Characteristics Categories n (%)
Degree of harm No harm 360 (51.9)
Recovery without sequelae after treatment 24 (3.5)
Temporary damage or side effects 307 (44.3)
Long term damage or side effects 2(0.3)

Permanent damage or side effects -

Death -
Types of injury* Pain 187 (39.3)
Laceration 72 (15.1)
Abrasion/Bruising 71 (14.9)
Edema/Swelling 54 (11.3)
Fracture 21 (4.4)
Head injury 19 (4.0)
Hematoma 9(1.9)
Others 43 (9.0)
Actions after fall* Observation 468 (52.2)
Diagnostic test (X-ray, CT, MRI, Laboratory) 217 (24.2)
Simple dressing 118 (13.2)
Transfer to ICU or ER 14 (1.6)
Operation 6(0.7)

* Multiple responses
4. A} o A 9 o] w7 140l 1994(9.6%), TEWL B4 7t
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Table 4. Improvement strategies for fall prevention.

N (%)
Total 2017 2018 2019
Variable Categories
(n=693) (n=205) (n=202) (n=286)
Risk patient Accompanying caregiver 491 (23.7) 136 (22.2) 146 (23.9) 209 (24.9)
management
Assist the mobility of patient 168 (8.1) 42 (6.9) 55 (9) 71 (8.4)
Urination management 115 (5.6) 34 (5.6) 31(.1) 50 (6)
Frequent rounding of patient’s room 53 (2.6) 22 (3.6) 13 (2.1) 18 (2.1)
Daily risk assessment of fall, & Labeling for the caution of fall 38 (1.8) 15 (2.4) 12 (2) 11 (1.3)
Recommended to use the restrain bandage 18 (0.9) 1(0.2) 7 (1.1) 10(1.2)
Medication schedule management 8(0.4) 6 (1) 0 (0) 2(0.2)
Environment Raising bed side rail & Wheelchair retention 199 (9.6) 59 (9.6) 60 (9.8) 80 (9.5)
management
Adequate range of call bell distance from patient 118 (5.7) 44 (7.2) 38 (6.2) 36 (4.3)
Arrangement of environment objects 96 (4.6) 24 (3.9) 26 (4.3) 46 (5.5)
Illumination management 57 (2.8) 20 (3.3) 20 (3.3) 17 (2)
Keep things close to the patient 22 (1.1) 8(1.3) 6 (1) 8 (1)
Education Education through providing guidebook 680 (32.9) 201 (32.8) 197 (32.2) 282 (33.6)
= F==Ke]
V. 02 8> 74.08 (£8.99)M]

S olgsiol WaBAS SHALE AL ol 5]
713 W SRS RustsAA A4 % Tl
4 w OEH§1Zﬂi—l%ﬂEXH@H%q

B T%-OJ &%%Ol EEME‘J 141 l Eﬂﬁ}i Aot
AAAY] AL 15%7F RIASE Yo Hi1stx] £t
A0 8 et ols -7 HilARte] § 31 o]
T Ao s AS SAlA it E2E A
%OlEE A oli A} \‘416; Az 9 A2 5o o]Fo]
A %R}OJ@A}H 5101-‘?—

P

21 Quality Improvement in Health Care

A

Yt A9 61.974191¢F &

o] Wi AF 66 12Aﬂ 1012} Aol7t A
= = =7

= X} 3 GOAll o]/l

81.8%Z AHA|5tAL EA7F 80.2%2H= ATH11] € A

o= Atmgr}.

o] AollA I FAart WA 4
¥%oH, ol
2} A 9] o]
2], 3ot 7p7ke ol #Ate] BEES HXsHe
A1) G4 o JE%% 73k 4art Azt HA & of
Uzt BeY 2E A
< AF3foF & AolH (1
EAI7F oty et HY HA
FAT AP A v 11 A B, QPAuE, i Ho] Fo

BA 5ol QA sk

i o
gty
re
—Ll
o
o
_|>:‘
r°l'
_\;
£
o)
IS
S

oY,
>
[
=
g
1o
>
2
1o
N
P
o



oAt 520 47 ofFS SISty Hgsfof At of
2 2EYAT, AY 52 9

A 2 24o] K53t ABA 5 S-S s A AR
% 21 1| go] Fasteh E3 o),
FAlo] 5 BRI T AHGOE 0|59 of2lgolt AelH]

olg], P4 o] A EHE2 A AlEHldS &5l
hsi]

I F{o
(o)
)
H—]
el
=2
)
;|
2

-0,
2
)
S
e

HPH A17H23:00-06:59)0]
ol w—rs}ﬂl WA o= Uepton], o]t Chott
Choi 59| AF12)9h L3
. WS 1A 8 BAEo] HEAE ALA P &
A} o] Esteict Yol WA A7} MBston, ofo
Ax}e] o] 52 o !

g =
9] ole= w1, 9 T SA S4EY 3\_']% %“4";‘ T
U Zojtt. EZE A, oA, FAIAYA, FHALY
FF 59 BF o E FESH HERZ([15] §F2A
© =280 A2 SolaL, g JFEe] FoF At
= 3719, Y Sy Al S5 H A oA
< 7t s5he 8% 52 5 94 A 5

o] AAA FAF 2x19] 87.6% (60778)7F
A9, Kangd Song? AF[101A4E &=
5

2
%, 45.5%)014 3ol wAysteict ol o
o =3

R3]
7 W B A FAolA o] BEgol wol A
o) gl B =BHL, A oA Wkt BEo| £
S0 WA AEelolE B} 914 L
3 FejetA BBt dafo] WSk Aoz Bl
SAp 2z A YRi4o] BThT AZEAL A
et A Alo] LB i WS F AATATHIG)
e ojmxlo] AZksHE Bae] UAF Rl Bt
A2t MH%J g ; 11}0]7} g% Azﬂai,ﬂ

b 205 Lee 591 91701 HEE BAES 14
o thpg A QA o171 Az wolEolA] gk

rl-EémE

A= wrAgelA] QS Aol QQalsta Tt UAF odr
S A E gRtel BHorte] Foirt Z a5t (18] YAt
A BAEl A4 A Bastet 4 ARAE e
2 3 G ABTold B G T A 27 52 A
2 AZsle] 27} Aele] TRYES 5o 94 L BEA

Abo]| st AZFAlS Zhy oufEkE-S AlAE 4 QI

=2

go] 2712 299 & 5 A
S MAddg ez YA dUE AsE S 150l
7P Bokal, ozt 5% 9 AF 240 F HAE AA
SHT. o= 7| ol A= EAket B oo A YA oS
= Akl Jlon W AutollM YA I EZAES o
el

Wb, 1 3 4%E 5 £
o Az Y A\ZHAol XL, W Aols, Auste dA LS
[21]0] A5t E 87 44 Folshn AlAshE 5
ol WL E3) olES ol Wt mAlE oo} 3
At

o] QoA BAEL R BA7} Qo] YA Wako] o
AR AT B9t o)) Ths] HEARE 1hEelo] Bt
Aol Aol Ao BAE QP Rolehe AZR
the B5Ao] f5} BAgle] AUEY A3 Foj}
Aol Wasith BIAE HoAA B o FLEE A
ook kit S oeES AUskn WAL A7

N R

VoL 29, Number 1, 2023 22



Korean Society for Quality in Health Care

Original Articles

g A5E AFT 5= Aoiok ot o] & HdlA= g
gotEofof dtt}[22]. vl=+2] ¢ SHARREH
S 9I3H —"‘—Uﬂxﬂi/ﬂ Clinical Nurse Leader (CNL)’::'

of AellA & ‘E'E“@t F2 Y2 QWOMW LAY
Ak, tiF2 9] ol ng ofight Y] Wlkrt
SeletE 984S ks otk o] Aol 267
o] Yapo] oA LA}, 1Y At v B
2 7 Sl s WESAY o] PR ofe
AETE BHA o2s|] wRL A7ko] Z7ltact
ol2 Ql8) Yol PHE FolArh. B/ BH A
2ol Ae] olgAt dah AR Wk e A
£g AM8stel B4 918 BE sk, 3 91
ol the) 4 clgBES sHatA o d24). ot
defgre] i Adely e Ao E} =7}
§ grtEToly] Bohe ozae] FEAQ Bl s
J_Hd g2t A ofo) wet U4t H 7
g 7h540] 1 9jegkat o Hla) Elglo
a1 gzl 47 Qlstel AYUSo] JAES AAEHA B~
5t e 4= 9l Alglolt), AAMA AL AARES 93
AL RAY elsiof she 97t Wi Aol @
5 1840 7] el Y4l G el o

T;

r:;: )
O\1 ol

ook

—_

7
74

A

iy l‘—‘?L
CLAIN
Fi?_‘i ol OIN

4=

ofl.

1o oy o
:::OIN

o)

HJ“
By
X

_412124

i

=
=

N ol o

g =

:9:

O
AYFE st Ao Atk o G4 9 &
Ao] sk Wb Bt opal MR 2] 7E Algats

o5t lzs|E W A AU 2ol o2

olfl £ 2F, Y94 e TR Uit dejHolE 25

ATFH25). o] AP/ BOIAE FA W FAIT &
HUE M, A dlol o] Fio] 24, FM W A
&3] R34, nneXA g o4 WA SO Were 4

sh3 glot AWA WOl FolE TF7IW) S4B

) J27} kol =90l A% AAH T ek
o AToIA YAk At Asglol TG, &

- @y B 5 o9 Aes Yehith ol Hag

i
4
3
of

N

23 Quality Improvement in Health Care

o whet 4ol dhat wu A= E}E7ﬂ st
SRR
LA et B) et Az
A A BAA
T GATE A A
A& 8 Flol= AFoR 19 YHES ol 2o

FRSIH20]. WAL o]F A 7IZF HYE Y Sk AlA
B8 ulEslo] B 1 0|3 ASRS AgslA| whetsla /Ay
b2 BAS " a7} Qltk. Sieh ARdof st o= ot

obUje} zkzte] 1o] cfste] M o] 50| ATHE AT
24 P50 +95t1 Yt Huo MY w2o] A

Q1 8tz olo] 4|1 e LFolof Bk,

N ol
o

W)
A

i

V.82
o] AT A AA A 2T A0 AFTHTAA

f
2

o O

)
LD
o oz
o nlo o o
o fr X 2L

A3t o, ol& EﬂLE._ I’_Eﬂa}x} IRIR
S 712ARE vFASHIA A E o] AR EA] ATtolth
2017Q95H 201997k4] 37 HalE 693719 94 &
Mg EYE RIS #HElY] o] Agton, 23
LR Bile JUleta YAk Eavt gASa S &
Astleh. e HlEo] w2 7| EH0=E YA
2} 5 /0] 85.9%F AHAISHL, 704 ol AP+ol

ol
02,‘.',
Y
F;J
>,
U
M«
ol
N
_\|L
;:E
_EL
1o
u
j;
ol
ﬁ>~l_4
)
ot
g,



©
N

o EEH Y ATH ALY RS ol &3 YA B BA

1. Morris R, O'Riordan S. Prevention of falls in hospi-
tal. Clinical Medicine. 2017:17(4):360.

2. World Health Organization. Falls [Internet]. Gene-
va, Switzerland: World Health Organization; 2021
[cited 2021 Sep 29]. Available from: http://www.
who.int/news-room/fact-sheets//detail/falls/.

3. Korea patient safety reporting & learning system.
Patient safety statistical yearbook [Internet]. Seoul,
Korea: Korea patient safety reporting & learning
system; 2020 [cited 2021 Sep 29]. Available from:
https://www.kops.or.kr/portal/board/statAnlrpt/
boardDetail.do.

4. Sato N, Hase N, Osaka A, Sairyo K, Katoh S. Falls
among hospitalized patients in an acute care hos-
pital: Analyses of incident reports. The Journal of
Medical Investigation. 2018;65(1.2):81-4.

5. Kang H, Zhou S, Yao B, Gong Y. A prototype of
knowledge-based patient safety event reporting
and learning system. BMC Medical Informatics and
Decision Making. 2018;18(5):110.

6. Yoon §J, Lee CK, Jin IS, Kang JG. Incidence of falls
and risk factors of falls in inpatients. Quality Im-
provement in Health Care. 2018;24(2):2-14.

7. Jin M, Ha Y. Influencing factors on hospital fall
prevention activities of tertiary hospital nurses and
general hospital nurses. Journal of Health Infor-
matics and Statistics. 2017:42(4):361-70.

8. Korea veterans health service. Hospital yearbook
[Internet]. Wonju, Korea: Korea veterans health
service; 2020 [cited 2021 Sep 29]. Available from:

https://www.bohun.or.kr/030manage/man-

age0206_04.php?left=1.

9. Cho MS, Lee HY. Factors associated with injuries
after inpatient falls in a tertiary hospital. Journal of
Korean Clinical Nursing Research. 2017;23(2):202-
10.

10. Kang YO, Song RY. Identifying characteristics
of fall episodes and fall-related risks of hospital-
ized patients. Journal of Muscle and Joint Health.
2015:22(3):149-59.

11. Ministry of Patriots and Veterans Affairs. Sta-
tus of national merit [Internet]. Sejong, Korea:
Ministry of Patriots and Veterans Affairs: 2021
[cited 2021 Sep 29]. Available from: https://
www.mpva.go.kr/mpva/selectBbsNttView.
do?key=181&bbsNo=54&nttNo=219873&-
searchCtgry=&searchCnd=all&searchKrwd=&inte-
grDeptCode=&pagelndex=2.

12. Choi EJ, Lee YS, Yang EJ, Kim JH, Kim YH, Park H.
Characteristics and risk factors for falls in tertiary
hospital inpatients. Journal of Korean Academy of
Nursing. 2017;47(3):420-30.

13. Korea patient safety reporting & learning system.
Patient safety theme reports [Internet]. Seoul,
Korea: Korea patient safety reporting & learning
system; 2018 [cited 2021 Sep 29]. Available from:
https://www.kops.or.kr/portal/board/statAnlrpt/
boardDetail.do.

14. Chan DK, Sherrington C, Naganathan V, Xu YH,
Chen J, Ko A, et al. Key issues to consider and in-
novative ideas on fall prevention in the geriatric
department of a teaching hospital. Australasian
Journal on Ageing. 2018;37(2):140-3.

15. Lee SY, Lee KS. Nocturia. Journal of the Korean
Medical Association. 2015:58(10):892-6.

16. Hwang SY, Shin §J. Predictors of fall prevention

behaviors in elderly inpatients. Korean Journal of

VoL 29, Number 1, 2023 24



Korean Society for Quality in Health Care

Original Articles

Health Promotion. 2013;13(2):76-85.

17. Lee JY, Lee JH, Jang YS, Kim EC, Ji YG, Park TZ,
et al. Status quo and innovative directions for in-
patient fall interventions. Journal of Korean Acad-
emy of Fundamentals of Nursing. 2020;27(4):356-
65.

18. Kim YS, Kim MS, Hwang JI, Kim HR, Kim HA,
Kim HS, et al. Experiences in patient safety edu-
cation of patient safety officer using focus group
interview. Quality Improvement in Health Care.
2019;25(2):2-15.

19. Rubenstein LZ, Josephson KR. Falls and their pre-
vention in elderly people: what does the evidence
show?. Medical Clinics. 2006;90(5):807-24.

20. Hur JY, Kim HJ. Relationship of risk factors,
knowledge and attitude to falls in elderly inpa-
tients. Journal of Korean Gerontological Nursing.
2009;11(1):38-50.

21. Kim SN. Effects of a multifactorial fall prevention
program on physical + psychological function and
home environmental hazards in community dwell-
ing low-income elderly. Journal of the Korean Ge-
rontological Society. 2012;32(2):377-95.

22. Kim YJ. Nurses' experience of inpatients' falls.
Journal of Korean Academy of Fundamentals of
Nursing. 2017;24(2):106-17.

23. Bender M, Williams M, Cruz MF, Rubinson C. A
study protocol to evaluate the implementation
and effectiveness of the clinical nurse leader care
model in improving quality and safety outcomes.
Nursing Open. 2021:8(6):3688-96.

24. Korea Institute for Healthcare Accreditation.
Hospital accreditation standards(ver3.0) [Inter-
net]. Seoul, Korea: Korea Institute for Healthcare
Accreditation; 2018 [cited 2021 Sep 29]. Available
from: https://www.koiha.or.kr/web/kr/library/es-

25 Quality Improvement in Health Care

tablish_board.do.

25. Kobayashi K, Ando K, Suzuki Y, Inagaki Y, Nagao
Y, Ishiguro N, et al. Characteristics of outpatient
falls that occurred in hospital. Nagoya Journal of
Medical Science. 2018;80(3):417.

26. Yoon SH, Kim KJ. Nurses' learning experiences
from falling accidents on patient safety. Korea

Journal of Hospital Management. 2015;20(2):1-14.



